
Ron's Staffing  

2nd Shift Sanitation 

Ron's Staffing 

Alsip, IL, US 

$18.5 / hr 

Full-Time 

Dental, life insurance, medical, paid time off, vision 

 

Job Description 

Facilities cleaning include warehouse, production equipment, offices and cafeteria. 
ESSENTIAL FUNCTIONS Clean offices, production equipment, warehouse areas. May 
clean restrooms, cafeteria Empty trash and transport to trash compactor Stock supplies 
MINIMUM REQUIREMENTS Education/Experience At least 1 yrs. work experience. 
Preferable experience in the food packaging industry. Skills/Knowledge of operating power 
equipment to aid in cleaning. Must be able to identify chemicals, know when to use them, 
and follow. Physical Demands Work is performed primarily in a fast-paced environment 
Required to frequently stand or walk for extended periods across designated facility. 
Schedule Must be flexible and available to work outside of designated shift hours and/or 
weekend hours when necessary Some overtime may be required 

 

About Ron's Staffing 

Ron's Staffing Services, Inc. is the leader in providing industrial temporary help. We pride 
ourselves on taking care of our employees better than anyone in the industry. Because of 
this, our employees have a great work ethic that they bring to our customers, which is a 
major reason for our success. 

 

To apply call: 708-690-2846 

 

https://www.ronsstaffingofillinois.com/ 

 

https://www.ronsstaffingofillinois.com/


Production Lead 

Ron's Staffing     

Alsip, IL, US 

$18 - $18.5 / hr 

Full-Time 

Dental, life insurance, medical, paid time off, vision 

Posted 21 days ago 

Job Description 

The Production Lead I responsibility is to maintain production rates to the highest. Ensuring 
that all finished goods meet customer's specifications, GMPS and internal SOPs. Essential 
Duties and Responsibilities * Make sure Quality Leaders are at the lines and ready to work 
15 minutes before shift starts. Maintain a safe work environment by educating and directing 
personnel on proper use of all equipment. Work together with other departments to 
accomplish the highest quality of goods, accurate reconciliations, flow of materials to the 
line 

About Ron's Staffing 

Ron's Staffing Services, Inc. is the leader in providing industrial temporary help. We pride 
ourselves on taking care of our employees better than anyone in the industry. Because of 
this, our employees have a great work ethic that they bring to our customers, which is a 
major reason for our success. 

To apply call: 708-690-2846 

 

https://www.ronsstaffingofillinois.com/ 

 

 

https://www.ziprecruiter.com/c/Rons-Staffing/Jobs
https://www.ronsstaffingofillinois.com/

	2nd shift sanitation
	Production Lead

